
BID TABULATION

Milford Elementary School

Bid Date - 8/1/2024

ITEM Bid Package Prime Bidder Base Bid 01 Combination Bid Alternate 1                 P & P 
Bond

Alternate 2           Delete 
Temp Cont

Alternate 3             Add 
BIM

Alternate 4    Foundation 
Exc

Alternate 5          Remove 
Spoils

03a MKS  $           2,798,000.00  $                      -    N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A 

04a Demuyt Masonry  $           2,987,000.00  $        (25,000.00)  N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A 
FCI  $           3,200,000.00  $          32,000.00 
Hagerman  $           4,192,000.00  $        (46,205.00)  $      (150,000.00)
Ziolkowski  $           3,199,170.00  $        (21,020.00)

05a Evans Metals  $           1,027,116.70  $            7,720.00 
JL Water  $           1,217,000.00  $        (11,000.00)

06a Gibson Lewis  $           2,899,000.00  $        (17,000.00)
MKS  $           3,218,500.00  $                      -   

07a Borntrager  $           1,132,364.00  $        (20,112.00)
Rooflynx  $              819,000.00  $        (17,000.00)
Sentry Roofing  $           1,052,924.00  $        (21,125.00)
SPG Roofing & Exteriors  $           1,127,447.00  $          22,125.00 

08a Architectural Glass & Aluminum  no bid 
Hall Aluminum  $              842,184.00  $        (14,484.00)
Interstate Commercial Glass & Door  $              660,000.00  $            8,000.00 
O'Neils Glass  $              707,000.00  $          (8,000.00)

09a Gibson Lewis  $           1,144,000.00  $          (7,000.00)
Kleckner Interior Systems  $           1,033,219.00  $        (15,000.00)
Rosema Construction  $              916,000.00  $        (17,500.00)

09b Jack Laurie Group  $              419,550.00  $          (5,000.00)
Strahm Group  $              470,585.00  $          (7,424.00)
Rosema Construction  $              484,700.00  $          (8,500.00)

09c Foster Specialty Flooring  $              129,200.00  $            1,000.00 
Jack Laurie Group  $              169,000.00  $          (2,800.00)
Kiefer Specialty Flooring  $              171,280.00  $            2,310.00 
Kuhn Specialty Flooring  $              129,100.00  $          (1,600.00)



   
 

11e Atlas Restaurant Supply  No bid 
Brackenridge Kitchen Equipment  $              772,197.00  $          (5,421.00)
Burkett Restaurant Equipment  $              749,975.00  $          (3,950.00)
C & T Design  $              750,900.00  $          (5,106.00)
Culinex  $              747,148.00  $          (4,200.00)
Great Lakes Hotel Supply  $              765,047.00  $          (4,185.00)  $            6,500.00 
Singer Equipment Ashland  $              702,595.00  $          (4,711.00)
Stafford Smith  $              773,364.00  $            4,082.00 

21a Current Fire Protection  $              418,595.00  $          (3,140.00)  $            7,800.00 
Shambaugh & Sons FP  $              343,700.00  $          (1,900.00)  $            4,400.00 
VFP  $              327,941.00  $          (1,950.00)  $          21,030.00 

23a A  Hattersley & Sons  $           5,096,250.00  $        (40,777.00)  $      (688,000.00)  $        100,600.00 
Core Mechanical  $           4,921,386.00  $      (134,442.00)  $      (694,880.00)  $          66,000.00 
Dilling Group No bid
G & L Corporation  $           6,462,251.00  $      (188,883.00)  $      (688,000.00)  $        125,000.00 
Griffen Plbg & Heating  $           5,787,700.00  $        (36,000.00)  $      (723,000.00)  $          65,000.00 
H & G Services No bid
Project Design Piping  $           5,154,890.00  $        (30,000.00)  $      (715,000.00)  $          58,500.00 
Wagner Meinert  $           5,340,000.00  $        (54,000.00)  $      (688,000.00)  $          (3,700.00)

   

26a D & D Electric  $           3,420,000.00  $          15,000.00 
Dilling Group  $           3,809,260.00  $        (34,000.00)  $          92,000.00 
H & G Services No bid
Kissinger Electric  $           2,598,000.00  $        (16,000.00)  $          15,000.00 
0

31a Beer & Slabaugh  $           2,350,000.00  $        (20,000.00)  $        750,000.00  $          27,000.00 
G & G Hauling & Excavating  $           2,322,182.00  $        (14,910.00)  $        349,345.00  $          23,870.00 

   

32a Brooks Construction  $              702,930.00  $          (6,960.00)
Niblock Excating & Asphalt  $              780,750.00  $          (4,000.00)
Phend & Brown  $              849,095.00  $          (2,000.00)

32b Bojrab Landscape No bid
Clounie Landscaping No bid
Meetzger Landscaping Bid rejected, not on required bid form

32c Gleave Construction  $                83,900.00  $          (1,600.00)
R & C Fence Bid rejected, not on required bid form


