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BID TABULATION

PROJECT: Blue Ridge CUSD #18-Blue Ridge Masonry Repair

FILE NO: 2523
DIVISION: General

BID DATE: 2/12/26
TIME: 2:00pm

BIDDER'S NAME

ACKNOWLEDGED

ADDENDUMS #'S

BID SECURITY TYPE/$

SIGNED SEALED

BASE BID

ALTERNATE BIDS

UNIT PRICES

REMARKS

No1l

No 2

No 1l

No 2

No 3

Berglund Construction Company
8410 S. South Chicago Avenue
Chicago, IL 60617

$447,000.00

$60,000.00

$65,000.00

$15/LF

$50/Brick

$1,000/SF

Bi-State Masonry, Inc.
4900 8th Ave.
East Moline, IL 61244

$379,000.00

$20,900.00

$21,900.00

$8/LF

$45/Brick

$35/SF

Blackridge Research & Consulting
4041 W. Hollow Creek Drive
Peoria, IL 61615

No Bid

Broeren Russon Builders, Inc.
602 N. Country Fair Drive
Champaign, IL 61821

No Bid

Duke McGinnis Consulting
3 Flower Lane
Valley Cottage, NY 12018

No Bid

E&H Restoration LLC
1926 Comenitz Dr
Davenport, IA 52802-2315

$405,988.00

$44,364.00

$52,678.00

$23/LF

$60/Brick

$4.25/SF

Glesco Electric Inc
3103 Tatman Ct., Suite 103
Urbana, IL 61802

No Bid

Otto Baum Company, Inc
866 N. Main Street
Morton, IL 61550

$318,570.00

$27,715.00

$33,210.00

$12/LF

$35/Brick

$5/SF

Petry-Kuhne Company
1701 Broadmoor Dr., Suite 120
Champaign, IL 61821

No Bid

Western Specialty Contractors
2501 N.Colt Road
Springfield, IL 62707

No Bid

Masons Masonry Restoration Inc
403 S 1st Street, PO Box 9
Brownstown, IL 62418

$295,655.00

$70,086.00

$55,286.00

$25/LF

$85/Brick

$95/SF

| hereby certify that the bids submitted by the bidders whose names are recorded above

were opened, read and recorded at the place and time specified in the bid information.

Owner's Representative:

Architect's Representative:




